
 

 

 

Egbert Road 
Faversham 

 
£650,000 

 

  Detached family home   Extended, open plan living space 

  Luxury fitted kitchen   3 double bedrooms plus dressing room 

  En suite to master bedroom   Integral garage 

 



 
16 Egbert Road, Faversham, ME13 8SJ 
 
Description:    
 
Property in Egbert Road is always highly sought after and quite honestly rarely 
available, so this stunning detached home is sure to attract a huge amount of 
attention so an early viewing is highly recommended.  

The location is ideal for all local amenities and provides easy access to the town 
centre and mainline railway station, with high speed trains to London St. Pancras 
and a regular service to Victoria. The property also falls into the catchment area 
for the Ofsted rated 'Outstanding' Ethelbert Road Primary School.  

On entering the house, the first impression is of quality. The current owners have 
expertly remodelled the house to suit their lifestyle and provides, spacious, 
adaptable accommodation that would suit a wide range of buyers and still has the 
flexibility and potential to create unique spaces for the individual. Originally a 4-
bedroom house, bedroom 4 has been transformed into a wonderful dressing 
room and bedroom 2 at the front is a stunning cinema room, complete with 
sound insulation and staged seating areas. Both of these rooms could easily be 
returned to bedrooms if required, or can continue in their current format. 
Downstairs, from the spacious hallway a beautifully fitted study is situated at the 
front of the house with bespoke furniture and storage creating a great home 
working space.  To the rear, the generous living space is open-plan with bi-fold 
doors opening into the garden and open fire which blends seamlessly into the 
dining area. A door leads from here into the incredibly well appointed, high 
quality fitted kitchen, with a range of appliances including wine coolers and a 
range style cooker. A downstairs cloakroom and integral garage complete the 
ground floor accommodation.  

Upstairs, the master suite offers a luxury en-suite bathroom and wet room, 
together with access into the dressing room. As described above, the 2nd 
bedroom is currently a cinema room and bedroom 3 is a good double facing rear 
and a family bathroom completes the picture.  

Outside the gardens are laid mostly to lawn with well stocked and established 
plants and shrubs. A beautiful willow tree overhangs a large, natural water fish 
pond and adjoins a paved patio area. To the front there is a hedge enclosed 
garden with path to front door and block paved driveway. 
 
 
 

 

 

Living/Dining Room:   27'3" max x 24'5" max (8.31m x 7.44m) 
 
Kitchen:   13'9" x 13'5" (4.19m x 4.09m) 
 
Study:   13'4" x 10'0" (4.06m x 3.05m) 
 
Garage:   16'4" x 7'10" (4.98m x 2.39m  

Bedroom 1:   15'9" x 10'8" (4.80m x 3.25m) 
 
Bedroom 2:   13'4" x 10'6" (4.06m x 3.20m) 
 
Bedroom 3:   11'1" x 9'1" (3.38m x 2.77m) 
 
Dressing Room:    
 
 
    
 

 

 


